LAXMLACPRT-113-HPRT-RUO0-HR83. XML

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

724

VOLUNTEERS IN PARKS

SEC. 118. Section 4 of Public Law 91-357 (16
U.S.C. 18j), as amended, is further amended by striking
“$3,500,000” and inserting “$5,000,000".

CONTRACTS AND AGREEMENTS WITH INDIAN AFFAIRS

SEC. 119. Notwithstanding any other provision of
law, during fiscal year 2015, in carrying out work involv-
ing cooperation with State, local, and tribal governments
or any political subdivision thereof, Indian Affairs may
record obligations against accounts receivable from any
such entities, except that total obligations at the end of
the fiscal year shall not exceed total budgetary resources
available at the end of the fiscal year.

HERITAGE AREAS

SEC. 120. (a) Section 109 of title I of Public Law
105-355 (16 U.S.C. 461 note) shall be applied for fiscal
year 2015 by substituting “2015" for “2014"".

(b) Section 157(h)(1) of title I of Public Law 106—
291 (16 U.S.C. 461 note) is amended by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$11,000,000”.

RATIFICATION OF PAYMENTS

SEC. 121. All payments made to school districts
under the first section of the Act of June 4, 1948 (62
Stat. 338, chapter 417; 16 U.S.C. 40a), during the period

beginning in fiscal year 1976 and ending on the date of

L:\vA120914\R120914.009.xml
December 9, 2014 (6:32 p.m.)



